
UOBWA Chemical Bid Tabulation

2026 BID TABULATION
Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals
Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

BIDDER
ACS-Aulick BMS-Brenntag CCO-Carus CCU-Chemtrade CSC-C&S HDC-Hydrocal

CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 840,000 $0.2550 $214,200.00 NO BID NO BID $0.2540 $213,360.00 $0.2040 $171,360.00 NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 1,050,000 NO BID $0.0948 $99,540.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHLORINE Ton 75 NO BID $1,748.0000 $131,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 150,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 150,000 NO BID NO BID $0.5500 $82,500.00 NO BID NO BID $0.6850 $102,750.00
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Gallon 1,650 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.8000 $17,820.00 NO BID

BIDDER
JCI-Jones PCI-Pencco SCC-Shannon SWT-Sterling USA-USAlco UUI-Univar

CHEMICAL UNIT QUANTITY BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE BID UNIT PRICE BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE Dry Pound 840,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2841 $238,644.00 $0.2070 $173,880.00
SODIUM HYDROXIDE Wet Pound 1,050,000 $0.1314 $137,970.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1075 $112,875.00
CHLORINE Ton 75 $1,790.0000 $134,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID Wet Pound 150,000 NO BID $0.2900 $43,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2700 $40,500.00
PHOSPHATE Wet Pound 150,000 NO BID NO BID $0.5430 $81,450.00 $0.5974 $89,610.00 NO BID NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE Gallon 1,650 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.4800 $30,492.00

ACS Aulick Chemical Solutions JCI Jones Chemical, Inc.
BMS Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. PCI Pencco, Inc.
CCO Carus LLC SCC Shannon Chemical Corporation
CCU Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC SWT Sterling Water Technologies LLC
CSC C&S Chemicals USA USALCO, LLC
HDC Hydrocal LLC UUI Univar Solutions USA Inc.
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