
Maintaining Flexibility in Training
and Approach While Improving
Fidelity

AEE’s CCAT enhances fidelity in the
field by standardizing core
competencies for practice and
aligning practitioner’s training and
experiences with these
competencies. 

Efficacy
The core competencies were
developed, reviewed, and revised by
top researchers and practitioners in
the field. AEE’s Certification Council
continues this work by regularly
revising competencies to reflect the
most recent research and state of
effective practice in the field. This
will help ensure the ethical and
effective treatment of clients.

Safety & Risk Management
The field of Adventure Therapy
benefits from having a clear
delineation for an experienced,
competent practitioner. This can
help safeguard high standards of
physical and emotional safety, as
well as rigorous risk management
strategies.  

Certified Clinical Adventure
Therapist Credential (CCAT)

Certifications

learn more and apply at www.aee.org/certifications

Individuals that achieve AEE
CCAT status can be confident that

they meet or exceed recognized
industry standards.

Key Outcomes:


