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What is Consecration? 

Consecration to the Immaculate Heart of 

Mary is an adventure that was started by 

three children in Fatima, Portugal: Jacinta, 

Francisco, and Lucia and continues with all 

that want to help the Holy Virgen triumph.  

The adventure consists of 3 parts which the 

Virgen Mary shows us: 

1. Pray with the . 

2. Make small sacrifices. 

3. Consecration to the Immaculate of 

Mary.  

Consecration to the Immaculate  of 

Mary means exchanging your  for the  

of Mary which only wants to console, heal, 

and give gifts and good ideas. She helps us 

to love God and each other more.  

To prepare, each day we will consecrate 

part of ourselves and of our life. We will 

think about what this means and pray that 

Jesus and the Virgen Mary will help us.  
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Week 1, Day 1: Pray the 1st Joyful Mystery of the 

Rosary, the Angel Announces to Mary God’s Plan. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my mouth, so that all that I say 
gladdens the Heart of God. Help me to offer to 
Jesus all that I say so my heart may be happy. 
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 



Week 1, Day 2: Pray the 2nd Joyful Mystery of the 

Rosary, Mary Visits Elizabeth. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my eyes, so that all that I see gladdens 
the Heart of God. Help me to offer to Jesus all that 
I see so my heart may be happy. 
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 1, Day 3: Pray the 3rd Joyful Mystery of the 

Rosary, Jesus is Born in a Manger. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my ears, so that all that I hear 
gladdens the Heart of God. Help me to offer to 
Jesus all that I hear so my heart may be happy. 
   

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 1, Day 4: Pray the 4th Joyful Mystery of the 

Rosary, Mary and Joseph Present Jesus in Temple. 

 Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my hands, so that all that I do 
gladdens the Heart of God. Help me to offer to 
Jesus all that I do so my heart may be happy. 
   

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 1, Day 5: Pray the 5th Joyful Mystery of the 

Rosary, Jesus is Lost then Found in the Temple. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my smelling, so that all that I smell 
gladdens the Heart of God. Help me to offer to 
Jesus all that I smell so my heart may be happy. 
    

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 1, Day 6: Pray the 1st Luminous Mystery of 

the Rosary, Jesus is Baptized in the River Jordan. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my intelligence, so that my desire to 
understand may not distance me from God. Help 
me to offer to Jesus all that I learn so my heart 
may be happy. 
    

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 1, Day 7: Pray the 2nd Luminous Mystery of 

the Rosary, the Wedding at Canaan. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my thoughts and memories, so they 
give me only peace, happiness, and more trust in 
God. Help me to offer to Jesus all that I think and 
remember so my heart may be happy. 
   

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 2, Day 1: Pray the 3rd Luminous Mystery of 

the Rosary, Jesus Proclaims the Kingdom. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my will. Help me to choose goodness 
and truth and give me strength to reject evil. 
   

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 2, Day 2: Pray the 4th Luminous Mystery of 

the Rosary, the Transfiguration. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today also, I 

consecrate my will. Help me to be obedient to my 

parents and teachers, like Jesus, who did all that 

you asked.   

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 

5th Commandment - Honor your parents. 



Week 2, Day 3: Pray the 5th Luminous Mystery of 
the Rosary, Institution of the Eucharist. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today also, I 
consecrate my will. Help me to forget myself so I 
may serve others the way Jesus did.  
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 2, Day 4: Pray the 1st Sorrowful Mystery of 
the Rosary, Jesus in the Garden of Gethsemane. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today also, I 
consecrate my will. Help me to always say like 
Jesus: “Father, not my will, but Yours be done”. 
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 2, Day 5: Pray the 2nd Sorrowful Mystery of 
the Rosary, Jesus is Scourged at the Pillar. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate all my humiliations. Help me to always 
forgive and to have hope and trust in God who 
loves me infinitely. 

 

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 2, Day 6: Pray the 3rd Sorrowful Mystery of 

the Rosary, Jesus is Crowned with Thorns. 

 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate all of my sufferings. Help me to always 
forgive and to have hope and trust in God who 
loves me infinitely. 
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 
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Week 2, Day 7: Pray the 4th Sorrowful Mystery of 

the Rosary, Jesus Carries His Cross to Calvary. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate all my sicknesses. Help me to always 
have hope and trust in God who loves me 
infinitely. 
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 3, Day 1: Pray the 5th Sorrowful Mystery of 

the Rosary, Jesus is Crucified. 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my tears. Help me to always to have 
hope and trust in God who loves me infinitely. 

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 3, Day 2: Pray the 1st Glorious Mystery of  
the Rosary, Jesus Resurrects from the Dead. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my Heart, today I 
consecrate the day of my Baptism, the day I 
entered the Church family. Fill my heart with love 
for the Pope, the priests, and especially for Jesus, 
present in the Eucharist. 
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 3, Day 3: Pray the 2nd Glorious Mystery of  
the Rosary, Jesus Ascends into Heaven. 
 
Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my family, so it may be more like the 
Holy Family and be a source of peace, light, and 
love. 

 

  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



Week 3, Day 4: Pray the 3rd Glorious Mystery of  
the Rosary, The Descent of the Holy Spirit. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my soul and every moment in prayer. 
Teach me to pray and to love God without limits 
and that my faith may always grow.  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 



Week 3, Day 5: Pray the 4th Glorious Mystery of  
the Rosary, Mary is Assumed into Heaven. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate all those who don’t know the love of 
Jesus. Help them to experience and accept that 
infinite love and to always grow in love and hope 
in Him.  
   

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 
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Week 3, Day 6: Pray the 5th Glorious Mystery of  
the Rosary, Mary is Crowned Queen of the 
Universe. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my soul and every moment in prayer. 
Teach me to pray and to love God without limits 
and that my faith may always grow.  
  

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 



Week 3, Day 7: Pray the 5th Glorious Mystery of  
the Rosary, Mary is Crowned Queen of the 
Universe. 
 

Oh Virgen Mary, Queen of my heart, today I 
consecrate my heart so I may love as you love. 
Also, I consecrate today all the people that I love, 
those that I don’t love, and those that don’t love 
me. 

“My God,  
I believe, I adore, I 

trust and I love 
you. 

I beg pardon for 

those who do not 

believe, do not 

adore, do not trust 

and do not love 

you.” 

 



 
  

My words to Jesus and Mary: 

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________ 

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________ 



  

My Words to Jesus and Mary: 

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________ 

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________

________________________________________________________ 

 



 

 

Mary, today I give you my heart and receive your  
Immaculate Heart so you may show me to love as You love. 

 
Oh Jesus, sweet and meek of Heart, make my Heart similar to Yours. 

Amen. 
(Pray the Glorious Mysteries of the Rosary or a different  

Mystery each day of the week after the Consecration) 

THE PRAYERS TAUGHT IN FATIMA 

“My God, I believe, I adore, I trust and I love you. 
I beg pardon for those who do not believe,  

do not adore, do not trust and do not love you.” 
 

When you do a sacrifice, say often: “Oh, Jesus, its for love of You,  
for the conversion of sinners…” 

 

After each Mystery of the Rosary: “Oh, my Jesus, forgive us our sins; 
save us from the fires of Hell; take all souls to Heaven, especially 

those in most need of thy Mercy.” 

 


